City of Asheboro March 13, 2014 Chemical Bid Tabulations

Liquid Liquid Flousilcic Sodium
Company Name Alum Caustic Acid Hypochlorite 12%
Amerochem Co No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NSF CERT ( )
Brenntag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NSF CERT ( )
C & S Chemicals $386.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
NSF CERT (X )
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC $285.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
NSF CERT ( X )
Delta Chemical Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NSF CERT ( )
GEO Specialty Chemicals $384.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
NSF CERT ( X )
Harcross Chemicals No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NSF CERT ( )
JCI Jones Chemicals No Bid $483.00 No Bid $0.570
NSF CERT ( X )
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NSF CERT ( )
Key Chemicals, Inc No Bid $499.00 $429.00 No Bid
NSF CERT ( X )
Mosaic Crop Nutrition, LLC No Bid No Bid $565.00 No Bid
NSF CERT ( X )
Pencco, Inc. No Bid No Bid $444.75 No Bid
NSF CERT ( X )
Suffolk Sales & Service Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NSF CERT ( )
Univar USA $287.00 $430.00 No Bid $0.658
NSF CERT ( X )
NSF CERT ( )
MINIMUM BID $285.00 $430.00 $429.00 $0.570
MAXIMUM BID $386.00 $499.00 $565.00 $0.658




